
SUPPLEMENTAL DAIRY MARGIN COVERAGE

Overview
Supplemental Dairy Margin Coverage (DMC) is for 
small and mid-size dairy operations with less than 5 
million pounds of DMC established production history 
that have increased milk production over time prior 
to 2020. Dairy operations may establish supplemental 
production history and enroll that supplemental 
production history in DMC during the 2023 coverage 
election period. Once Supplemental production history 
is established will be included in future DMC contracts 
and requires no additional action from the dairy 
operation.

Who is Eligible?
For participation in 2021 Supplemental DMC, dairy 
operations must meet the following:

•	 DMC established production history of less than 
5,000,000 pounds

•	 2019 milk marketings must exceed established 
DMC production history

•	 Have an approved supplemental production 
history for the dairy operation on CCC-800A

•	 Agree to the terms and conditions prescribed by 
CCC.

Enrollment
2023 DMC Coverage Election Period will occur:   
October 17, 2022 through December 9, 2022.

Contact your local USDA Service Center to apply.

How it Works
Supplemental DMC Production History

To determine the dairy operations supplemental 
production history:

The dairy operations DMC established production 
history is subtracted from the dairy operations 2019 
milk marketings with the result multiplied by 75 
percent.

2019 Milk Marketing Statement

To establish supplemental production history, the 
dairy operation must provide a record of 2019 milk 
marketings in pounds. County Offices will provide a 
copy of the 2019 marketing statement in the dairy 
operation DMC file folder.

For More Information
For more information about FSA programs, visit 
fsa.usda.gov or contact your local USDA Service 
Center. To find your local USDA Service Center, visit 
farmers.gov/service-center-locator.

This fact sheet is for informational purposes only; 
other eligibility requirements or restrictions may apply.

USDA is an equal opportunity provider, employer and lender.
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